
With trembling hands and a heart alight, I place pen on paper in a procrastinated 
attempt to secure your attention and express my feelings.

In the depths of my soul, a symphony of emotions yearns to be expressed, but how can 
I make you understand the boundless affection I hold for you, when it is but a solitary 
flame that burns only within me. From the moment our eyes met, an undeniable 
connection sparked, igniting within me a fire that has never waned. Through stolen 
glances and whispered dreams, I have watched you from afar, and each encounter has 
sent a surge of longing through my veins, fueling the fire and stoking a yearning for a 
love that I knew could never be mine.

 As I pen these words, my heart quivers with a sweet ache that has become both a 
burden and a strange comfort. I dare not utter your name, in the presence of those few 
we both know, for fear of revealing the secret that I have held close for far too long.

 I understood that my love would be forever unrequited. I had no illusions that you 
shared my affections. Yet, I cannot resist pouring out my soul to you now in this final 
letter. It is my only solace, a way for me to express the emotions that have consumed 
me without fear of judgment. I tried to quell these feelings, to convince myself that they 
were merely a fleeting infatuation, but my heart refused to be silenced. It yearned for 
your presence, your laughter, the warmth of your embrace, and it drove me on.

With each passing day, my love for you intensified, becoming an unyielding force that 
guided my every thought and action. Your laughter, as melodious as a summer breeze, 
filled my heart with unbridled joy. Your smile, a beacon of warmth, dispelled all shadows 
that lingered. Your presence filled my thoughts and coloured my world with a bittersweet 
hue. I saw your reflection in the morning dew and heard your voice in every breath of 
wind. Those brief fleeting moments when I was with you were a precious gift, a tapestry 
woven with memories that I will cherish eternally. 

I know that confessing my feelings would have only brought pain to both of us, and so 
the un-whispered words that I longed to say will forever remain a silent secret. Time 
would heal my broken heart, or so they said, but I see now that it was never meant to 
be. I doubt I will ever forget the love that I held for you, unrequited though it was.



Although the absence of your love left a void within me, your presence grounded me, 
and provided a sanctuary where I could find solace and peace. When you left, my life 
became a constant reminder of a love I could not have. The silent love that was my 
solace became my torment, a torment which I can no longer bear.

As I seal this letter with a kiss, I pray that you feel the depth of my emotions through 
these words. May it serve as a reminder to you that you were, and are, loved. That love 
will endure throughout eternity. Feel no sorrow or pain for me, your presence illuminated 
my life with an unparalleled radiance, casting a warm glow upon my darkest days.  With 
the last breath I take, I will remember your kind eyes, your gentle smile, and I will move 
on filled with a love that knows no bounds.

Yours Forever  


